\ 2

SRIITON FELRTRTHTD

QTR 0, BSB
)
-V dondna, 3R, O, FuED, J0IV(=nP, OP TETHF, OFYH) go. 8Y
Part—IVA BENGALURU, SATURDAY, 03, FEBRUARY, 2024(MAGHA, 14, SHAKAVARSHA, 1945) No. 58

DEPARTMENT OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT
NOTIFICATION
NO: DPAL 39 SHASANA 2023, BENGALURU, DATED: 03.02.2024

The Karnataka Stamp (Amendment) Bill, 2023 /G338, 20240 52030 3one’
03:3¢ DJVOTHOL) UaZsa0T 2w i BRVIAW),, Aedios; 3Ha3PImen 1w,
20240 FTIFET 9DAODED A0Sy 04 D0WITRN FUFET TozsBI I3
Tozs@B YT (3on-1V) 0Dhe) BBE3ARITOmD 3t dRIDNGS, -

KARNATAKA ACT NO. 04 OF 2024

(First Published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on the 3« day of February,
2024)

THE KARNATAKA STAMP (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2023
(Received the assent of the Governor on the 3t day of February, 2024)

An Act further to amend the Karnataka Stamp Act, 1957.

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Stamp Act,
1957 (Karnataka Act 34 of 1957) for the purposes herein after appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy fourth
yearof the Ryubh’c India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
KarnatakaStamp (Amendment) Act, 2023.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 30.- In the Karnataka Stamp Act, 1957,
(Karnataka Act 34 of 1957) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act) in section

30, in clause (a), for Article No. [52] (b) and the entries relating thereto, the following
shall be substituted, namely:-

“No. [52] (b) (Transfer of any interest secured by a bond, mortgage deed or
policy of insurance),

©)



e

No. [56] (if relating to paper bank guarantee and e-bank guarantee].—’;

3. Amendment of the Schedule.- In the Principal Act, in the Schedule,-

| (i) in Article 3, in column (3), for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words
“one thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

(ii) in Article 4, in column (3), for the words “twenty rupees”, the words “One
hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

(iii) in Article 5,-

(@)

(b)

fc) .

(d) in clause (i-e),-
(i) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees One
hundred”, the words, “Rupees Five hundred” shall be
substituted; and
(ii) in sub-clause (ii)), for the entries in column (3), the following
shall be substituted, namely:-
“Rupees Five hundred plus rupees hundred for every rupees
one lakh orpart thereof, in excess of rupees one lakh.”
(e) in clause (j), in column (3), for the words, “two hundred rupees”
the words, “five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.
(iv) in Article 6,-
(@) in clause (1),- .
(i in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the figures and words, “0.1
percent”, the figures and words “0.5 percent”, shall be substituted;
(ii) in sub-clause (ii), for the entries in column (3), the following
shall be substituted, namely:-
“0.5 percent of the loan or debt amount”,
(b) in clause (2),-

in clause (b), in column (3), the words “subject to a maximum
of rupees one thousand” shall be omitted,

in clause (e}, in sub-clause (ii), in column (3), for the words, “ten
paise”, the words, “fifty paise” shall be substituted, and for the
words “subject to a maximum of rupees twenty thousand but
not less than rupees Five hundred”, the words “but not less
than rupees Five hundred” shall be substituted;

in clause (i-d),-

(i) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “RupeesOne
hundred”, the words “Rupees Five hundred” shall be
substituted; and

(ii) in sub-clause (ii) for the entries in column (3), the the
followingshall be substituted, namely:-

“Rupees Five hundred and in addition Rupees Five hundred for
every Rupees ten lakhs or part thereof in excess of Rupees ten
lakhs, subject to amaximum of Rupees Ten lakhs.”;



a

(1) in sub-clause (i) in column (3), for the figures and words, “0.1
percent”, the figures and words “0.5 percent”, shall be substituted;
and

(ii) in sub-clause (ii)), for the entries in column (3), the following
shall be substituted, namely:-

“0.5 percent on the loan or debt amount”.

(v) in Article 8, in clause (b), in column (3) of, for the words “one hundred
rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

(vi) In Article 10, for the entries in column (3), the following shall be
substituted, namely:-

“Rupees Five thousand for every rupees ten lakhs or part thereof subject to
a maximum of rupees One Crore.”

(vii) In Article 11, in clause (b),-

(a) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words and figures
“3/4 % of the amount or market value”, the words and
figures “1 % of the amount or market value.”, shall be
substituted;

(b) in sub-clause (ii), for the entries in column (3), the
following shall be substituted, namely:-

“1 % of the amount or market value.”; and
(c) in sub-clause (iii), for the entries in column (3), the following
shall be substituted, namely:-
“1 % of the amount or market value.”
(viii) in Article 12,-
(@) in clause (a), for the entries in column (3), the
following shall be substituted, namely:-
“Two Rupee for every one hundred rupees or part thereof
subject tominimum of rupees one hundred.”; and
(b) in clause (b), for the entries in column (3), the
following shall be substituted, namely:-
“Two Rupee for every one hundred rupees or part thereof
subject tominimum of rupees one hundred.”
(ix) in Article 14,-

(a) in clause (b), in column (3), for the words, “One hundred
rupees.”, the words “Five hundred rupees”, shall be
substituted; and

(b) in clause (c), in column (3), for the words, “One hundred
rupees.”, the words, “Five hundred rupees”, shall be
substituted.

(x) in Article 17, in column (3), for the words “Five hundred rupees.”,the
words, “Two thousand rupees”, shall be substituted.

(xi) in Article 19, in column (3), for the words “Two hundred rupees.”,the
words “Five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted.



(xii) in Article 20,-
(a) in clause (4),-
(i) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “three percent”,
the words, “five percent” shall be substituted and for the words
“An amount equal to one per cent”, the words, “An amount equal
to five per cent”, shall be substituted; and
(ii) in sub-clause (ii) in column (3), for the words, “three percent”,
the words “five percent” shall be substituted, and for the words,
“An amount equal to one per cent”, the words, “An amount equal
to five per cent”, shall be substituted;
(b) in clause (6), for the entries in column (3), the following shall be
substituted, namely:-
“Two rupee for every one thousand rupees or part thereof
subject to a maximum of rupees five lakhs.”;
(c) in clause (7), in column (3), for the words “three percent”, the
words “five percent”, shall be substituted.
(xiii) in Article 21,-
(@) in clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “five rupees”, the
words, “twenty rupees” shall be substituted; and
(b) in clause (ii), in column (3), for the words, “ten rupees”, the
words, “fifty rupees”, shall be substituted.
(xiv) in Article 22, in clause (b), in column (3), for the words “five hundred
rupees”, the words, “one thousand rupees”, shall be substituted.
(xv) in Article 25, in column (3), for the words “one hundred rupees”, the
words “five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.
(xvi) in Article 31, in column (3), for the words “one rupee”, the words
“ten rupees” shall be substituted.
(xvii) in Article 33, in clause (a), in column (3), for the words “One thousand
rupees”, the words, “Five thousand rupees”, shall be substituted.
(xviii) in Article 34,-
(a) in clause (c),-
(i) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words “ten rupees”, the
words “fifty rupees”, shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-clause (ii), for the entries in column (3), the following shall be
substituted, namely:-

“Fifty rupees plus five rupees for every rupees one thousand
or part thereof in excess of rupees one thousand.”;
(b) in clause (d),-
(i) in sub-clause (i), for the entries in column (3), the following shall
be substituted, namely:-
“Rupees fifty for every rupees ten thousand or part thereof.”; and

(ii) in sub-clause (ii), for the entries in column (3), the following shall
be substituted, namely:-

“Rupees fifty for every rupees ten thousand or part thereof.”




(xix) in Article 39,-
(a) in clause (a),-

(i) in sub-clause (1), in column (3), for the words “Rupees one
thousand for each share”, the words “Rupees Five thousand for each share.”,
shall be substituted;

(i) in sub-clause (2), in column (3), for the words “Rupees five
hundred for each share.”, the words, “Rupees Three Thousand for each share.”
shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (b), in column (3), for the words “Rupees two hundred
and fiftyfor each share”, the words “Rupees One thousand for each share.”,
shall be substituted; and

(c) in clause (c), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees two hundred
and fiftyfor each share”, the words, “Rupees One thousand for each share.”,
shall be substituted.

(xx) in Article 40.-

(a) in clause (B), in sub-clause (a), in column (3), for the words
“threepercent”, the words “five percent”, shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (B), in sub-clause (b), in column (3), for the
words “One thousand rupees”, the words, “two thousand
rupees”, shall be substituted;

(c) in clause (C), in sub-clause (a), in column (3), for the words
“threepercent”, the words “five percent”, shall be substituted;
and

(d) in clause (C), in sub-clause (b), in column (3), for the words
“One thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees”,
shall be substituted.

(xxi) in Article 40-A,-

(a) in clause (A),-

(i) in sub-clause (a), in column (3), for the words “One thousand
rupees”, the words “five thousand rupees”, shall be
substituted;

(i) in sub-clause (b), for the entries in column (3), the following
shall be substituted, namely:-

“Rupees Five thousand plus rupees one thousand for every
rupees five lakhsor part thereof, exceeding rupees ten lakhs
capital amount, subject to a maximum of rupees Twenty five
lakhs.”; and

(b) in clause (B), in column (3), for the words, “three percent”, the
words, “five percent”, shall be substituted.
(xxii) in Article 41,-

{a) in clause (a), in column (3), for the words “one hundred rupees”,

thewords “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (b), in column (3), for the words, “one hundred rupees”,

the words “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted;

(c) in clause (c), in column (3), for the words, “one hundred rupees”,

thewords “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted;

(d) in clause (d), in column (3), for the words, “two hundred rupees”,

thewords, “one thousand rupees”, shall be substituted;



&

(e) in clause (f), in column (3), for the words “rupees fifty”, the words
“onehundred rupees”, shall be substituted;

() in clause (g), in column (3), for the words, “rupees fifty”, the
words “one hundred rupees”, shall be substituted; and

(g in clause (h), in column (3), for the words, “two hundred
rupees”, thewords, “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted.

(xxiii) in Article 44, in clause (b), in column (3), for the words “one hundred
rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees”, shall be substituted.
(xxiv) in Article 45, in clause (c), in column (3), for the words “ rupees one
hundred”, the words “rupees two hundred”, shall be substituted.
(xxv) in Article 47 ,-
(a)in clause (a), in column (3), for the words "Fifty paise”, the words
“two rupees”, shall be substituted; and
(b)in clause (b), in column (3), for the words, “rupees two hundred”,
thewords, “rupees five hundred”, shall be substituted.
{(xxvi) in Articie 51, in clause (b}, in column (3}, for the words, “one hundred
rupees”, the words “two hundred”, shall be substituted.
(xxvii) in Article 52,-

(a) in clause (b), in sub-clause (ii), in column (3), for the words “one
hundred rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees”, shall be
substituted; and

(b) in clause (c), in column (3), for the words “one hundred rupees”,
thewords “two hundred rupees”, shall be substituted.

(xxviii) in Article 54,-

(@) in clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees One
Thousand.”, the words, “Rupees Two Thousand.”, shall be
substituted; and

(b) in clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees One
Thousand.”, the words, “Rupees Two Thousand.”, shall be
substituted.

(xxix) after Article 55 the following shall be inserted, namely ; -

“56. if relating to bank guarantee,-

(i) if relating to paper bank guarantee | Rupees three hundred
(ii) if relating to e-bank guarantee Rupees two hundred

By Order and in the name of
the Governor of Karnataka,
(G. SRIDHAR)
Secretary to Government
Department of Parliamentary
Affairs and Legislation



P-4

JOID one) 23 e = ©

[ZIAY ORI
Zo8l;: Wosd; ey 39 Toxs 2023, Worives), DTR0ST: 03.02.2024.

The Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 (Karnataka Act 26 of 1963)0
FTOe S5-A ORODE), Toz;mo0D0R HFINAYAE the Karnataka Stamp
(Amendment) Act, 2023 (Karnataka Act No.04 of 2024) O 2300030, &950T,3
TI,B RG;P0WD TIRFET UonsBITW  IHR  TotusIYT  (oni-1V)  0e).
TFE3RICFTOR) 33 DR NG, -

20240 T0eF &% 9DAohad Joads: 04
(2024 T 2330 3on¥ 03 ¢ DIVOTLIOR) FUFEIT Doz IET IBea T0IFOHE), BRTEN
@DTé&Iena)

FUF&T X9,01) (3T BH) oD Dahad, 2023
(2024 G 3529330 3on¥ 03 Tt DTIOTLOW) Doy WODOT tad, Aobah, BBCHEBNE)

TOFET A0 PO, 1957, IR, 3TNJR B 2,00
900D,

BE), BRVLEFINOT FORIWTE LVTLBNLMON FoOFLT D0 DDODED,
1957 (19570 TIFET ©RIOHED 34) ), DIFD), TR SRR
O30T NTIIHTBOOT;

QD P03 NEPT%E  dB,T,0, R - SREBE), TIOEET  Towg
L)POTEDOBODOT S N0DT0I 9D NIeTNE):-

1. B0 W, BRO) DI, 9T0Y.- (1) S BPIOHEEI, FRELT 7,08
(3T TL) RACHED, 2023 DOTH FBONIF,E,..

(2) AT & BRBECS D 03T,

2. 303¢ RyTO0PW STH HD.- TOUFET 9,08 IDIODD, 1957 (19578
TOOEET VRIODD 34)C (ABTE), [T,EN0T  THRO  e9DARTHSOT)
B3 fDADNG) 303 FFOTAS () DOBE NBLE KO. [52] (29) &3, T3,
ROWORAT FehRTNY 22TesoN S8 sNODTT, 5380383 IT,L,, DOTT:-

“RO. [52] (D) (WOFBI), WIS BI) 9T DD DTOOAOD HAOT
PEBRRPLAE O30T 2I0AS0D SMeca3m)

XO. [56] (BBT* 230;0F° MOs00€3 s3I, B-239;0F° MO;00&31 B0WORITL) ).~

3. ®HIR WD W FJR.- DR PINTNEER e9ALBODE) -

() 3 OINELTE (3)K FPOOTE), “0TD JRT) CRTIANNYY” 0w JENY
BN 2,083 eIV CRTANTH” D02 WERPN, B S3RLRIIT,T),.

(i) 43¢ JBLTE B)N TPOOIL), "¥,3), TRTIONNL)” D0 ITNY
2B 2,083 BT BRTIAN” DO VBT, BB eCREIET,.

(i) 5K eI LT3 -

() DOR (W) DA 3) FOLOTE), “NOR,, 20T AT BTN
LE¥TE)," DO BRI, VD DRBIZT,;




5]

@) OB ([) DR WBNOR (VAR () TPOOITE), "WI), FyA”
D0 BJENY WBOR ‘B3, FyA” N0V VINF, F3A3ABASTE, D3I,
‘9B, 3B, AT CRBOCNNY 70N, B3 O ST TeTANNPT FThed
YO T, WPBED,” 0 TTNY TN “e3T3T 8083 ST CRTIONNDT FTD
9 5303" D0V JIWNTI, 3R AITT,,
(2) OB (83-8) ODE). -
(i) SRR (i) BN (3)3 TPLOTE), "0t JeT: Cemechiesh” d0W
TENY WEOR “th ST ST D0W BWNFR, &SA3RIST,T,,
IRV )
(i) ev@BDOB (i) T), B)X TFLOIOS TDRWING WIUN &k
ENODTE, TyB03RLBRIT,E),, ROWT:-
‘2033 JBRTY CRTIONT DI, F)d B3I, OF CRTONNPT 95300
B3y, ©F CToCNTRY, DT BT 2o, NOR, B3, ©F CTNNPN
WIBE,, B2D,O0IN 8053 FRT G NNED.".
(&) VOB (80-]) ONE), -
(i) SORBDOR (i) B (3):¢ FOOOTE), “2,083) FSRTI CRFTICANNE)" D0
[EnY WEOR ‘DB ST CRTIONNTY” 0w  JWNYI,
=3B RCRAIT,L,; D3I,

(i) ev@BDOR (i) BE). (3R FVOIART JeNRTINPT WWN B
NODTT, B3R RIT,E,, OB

“0E3) SRV BRBONTE BRIN 2wOW) ©OF CRDIONNFR, 0T
)3 20T ©F CRTO) 95330 e9TT 230M1F), 20T BT CeeTIANTE.".

(<3) DOAR (&) OHOR (3)3¢ ToOTE), “DTR ST CRTICNNE” DOW
IenY wBOR ‘O SeD TCRTIONNY' D0V  IWNYS),
= 303eeRR3T,E,;

(iv) 6:3¢ e9WLBTE,,-

() 20T (1) B,

(i) SVBOB (i) TR (3) FTLOITE), “3.0.1" QO VLI DI, LWOINY
22BN “3.05" 0 BT DI, LVOINTY, B)SARCBAIT,TN,; 2D3IY,

(i) eVBVOR (i) TE), B TPLOIJOR TENRTINAPT TN Bk
FNODIBR, TFy3C3RLREIT,E,, DOWT:-

"TRE e95aT0 I BRIT 3€.0.5"

(29) OB (2) BE),,-

(i) SVBOT (i) TR () TLORTE), “3.0.1" DOV BT NI, LOINY
BN 305" D02 B DI, 90INY), T 3ABRERAIT,T,; 203,

(i) evRBOB (i) B, B)H FOOIAS IDRWINPT BTN Bk
FODTITD, &303RERRIT,L,, DOWT:-

"I 930 2T RVRIT H.0.5";

v 83 OELBT (D) POBRAN BN TLOTEA), WO T
BRATIONNY)" H0 JENY EOR ‘0B SRV TRTONNEY" 0w
BERID, BB RERIITR..



&

v) 10X ONBLIT BN FOIAS TRTNSR PN o
ENODIT, &3 RCBRIT,),, OBT:-

O, 20T FeE Cemaddnidn weméd, T8 B, ©F Ceaecnen
953230 T30 29N T, 80530 ARedT CReaoNe)".

(vii) 11:3¢ €922 LB () ORBTE) -

() eva@OR (i) BAS (3) TOOIE), "BRIT WFe 3TCHTEI,
BP0;T see3 FTWo 3/4003" 0 BEREH aH3y, €9037Y BN BRI
OFDT 3TNTE, WP S HIwe 1003" D0 JWAY DI,
030D, T3 eCBAIT,T,;

() TR (i) B, (3 OIS [THRTNLR wEZeIN ok
FODITIN, T303RLBRIT,T,, DOWT:-
BRIV 530 500)TE, s30T te3 ST 1803"; sh3y,

() TROR (iii) 0, (3 FOOJAR T[DRBINOR wderon o
EODITIN, T303tBRIT, T, R0TT:-

‘RRIT 0 BTTEL, 35PeT3 ahte3 JevtEe 1003".
(viii) 123t ©9:3023. L33, -

(D) VOB (D) T, (A WOOINS [eDRBNSR WEeTPN Sh
FTODIT, &y303e(BAIT, T, 0BT -

T, 2,00 JRTC) CATIONNLH 2wFBED, Hd 2,03 [P
Ol Neh 950 &80 23NT, DOR) CRTION.”; sH3I),

(D) poB Q) 8, B TOINST TDHRBASOR wEZeroh &k
0DTE, B3 RCRRIF,E., DOTT:-

FOR, WO VT CRTONNPR w¥ed, @3 203 [eDd
ST 95330 9T LN, U BRT)."

(ix)  143¢ 9T LBTE) -

() DOR () DA (3)3¢ Fo0JE). “2,083) FRTI BRTICANNL)" 0
IONY  wBOR ‘W  JeB  CeTAN Q0w BRI,
B33P R BT, sH3),

~ (2) OB (A) AR (3K FoL0JE), 20T JRTY BRTONINE” 02
IO TR D SRT  CRTIONNY 0w BERYRD,
B 303028 IIT,T,.

) 173X 9223 LB (3)3€ Fo0RE). “8IR) SR CRTICNNL)” DO
ICNY  0BOR  ‘D0@  TWIT  CRTINN” 02 BBNAP,
F 3B REBRITE.,.
) 193¢ 9ELBBAR (3)I FTOTE). “DTEY IRTY BeTIN”
Q0w JITNY BOR 0D SRV TAWIANNL” ©0w JBERAT,
T3 RCBRIT,I,.

(xii) 20:3¢ €932 LTRSS, -
() DOT (4)TE).,-




9le)

(i) SVBDOR (i) BT (3)K ToDORE), “BHTFTE NRTTaR),"” D02 VWM
BN “HBT OWIRY," D0 BWNF, &3BRCBRITE, DI, "HFTRB
2,008, ADTE WRWOM" 00 VIWNY WHN "HIB 08T, R0l
RRWOT” D0 BBNYI, F303tBRITE,; eI,

(i) VB0 (i) B (3)3¢ FoOIE), "FHT e 3DRTVT R, 02 BENY
BN “FT@e DWIRY," D02 JITNF, TSABRERIIT,T, DI, "R
20TF, FeDPTIE BRWONY” D0V BHINY VTN "HFIB 00T, AoVl
RWRWONMN” Q0W BWNYI, F303L(BRIT,E,,

() (6)3 DOBTE), (B)H FTeLOIAST SENRTINY WIBPN &

ZWODTITD, T3S eLBAIT,B),, DOTT:-

MO\, O ©OF OCRTIONNER wIBED, T8 0T AT

CRTIONNY) 950 9T 0MT, O Ce&T0N";

) O3 DOBBARS (3)¢ ToOIE), "FFE NRTTRY,” DOW

SO WBOR “BeBE OBORY,” DO VBENFRD, 303 3T,

(xii)) 213¢ BLIT3E),,-

() OB (i) BOR () FoOTE), “80T3) TRTIONTIT” D0 BWNY
22BN “Q&,3), CRTIANNL)" D02 VBN, F3A3BRIT,I,,; sD3),

() DOAR (i) BN (3)3 ToOIE), ‘@I, BRTIAWNE” D0V BVENY
22BN “6033), CRTIONTEH” 02 BBNRYRD, &3A3RCBAIT,I,.

xiv) 2283¢ ©NBLBBOAS () DOBT (3 ToOOIEL), "8 IRV

CRTIONNY)" D0W IJRNY WHROR “2WORD AT TRTIONNF” QO

IENY, 3803eCRRITI,..

(v)  2583¢ ©9NBLBREOS () To0ID), “2,0T0 JRTY TRTONTIED”
R0V JIFINY 2BOR 05D  J[RTY)  CRTONNYY’ N0V  IWNTS,
230308 R 3T,

(vi)  313¢ e9BLBTAS (3)3¢ ToOIE), “20TD BRTION" DO IJWNY
TN "@BR), CRTONNY)” D0V BWNY, &3 RERAIT,E,.

(xvii) 333¢ ONBLEBEOS (D) VOBE () FOOJIL), “2,0TD AT

CRTONNY)" N0 JEAY WHONR "208) AT TRTIANNL)” QO

BRI, TS RERIITR),.

(xviii) 34:3¢ LD BLBBOR -

() DOT (A)oDE),-
(i) VB0 (i) BER 3)E FoORTE), "), CRTIONNEY” ROW JINE

WTOR “6033), CRTIONNYD” D02 BWNFR, &)303CBRAIT,T),,;

(i) evBOB (i) B (33 FOIAS JNRTINPR WEeRN S

BVODIT, B303tBAIT,R),, ROTT:-

"80833), CRTOONNE) ToNe &8¢ 20T AT BRTICNYT 93eTe
20T ARe)T BRTIONNF ), DT 93T ¢30NT, 80830 CRT2ONNE”

() OB (B)OH)S, -

(i) evBDOR () 8, () TOOIAS J[DRWINPR BN &8

FODITI,, F3a3eLRAIZT, T, QOTT:-

‘B8 B®I), AT TRETONNY) P BT Pand, 8033,

CRETONY)"; eI,



00

(i) ev@WDOB (i) Te), B) FTOOJNST TNRWINYR @R Sk
FODTTI, W83t BARIT,E,, NOLT:-

‘B8 ®I), AT TCRTIANNY) Fwe TO  YPond, 60e33,
o VoTAnIoWMaL>4%8
(xix) 3953€ L9NWLTTE) I,

() DOTB (Q)OHE),,-

(i) GVTOR (1) B (3)3¢ FTOLOTE). €905 33030 @R 2,080
A0 CRETONN)” Q0W JITNY BN M0 &3ABL0E @R TH
700 CR@ANN" 202 VWY, 303t RIE,0,;

(i) QVBDOT (2) BAS (3) FOTE), “eI0T )83 0TD @R 8T
BP0 CRTONNT)” D0 ITWNY WHBIR “205 T3A3e0TH @R RT3

- Z9e)0 BRTIANTH" 02 BENT, H33RERIITE,:

() VOB (D) BAR (3)3¢ FoDOIE). “&0T &3ABLOED TR T
SRT 2e33), CRTANTS)” D0 JWNY BN 90T &30 @R
2,08 AT BRTIONNF" D0 VBN, &303RCBRITEY,; a3,

(3) DOA (A) BRI (3)3¢ Fo0Te), “e905 T33ROT) @R DT
NPT 80833), CREIONNT” Q0 JTNY BN "e905 30300 TR
WOT) ARe)T CRTIONNF” D02 BRNYRD, &3803eCBR3T,00,.

(xx) 4038 9D LTIBE), -

(Q) OB (W) B NTROR ()3 (3)3 FOTE), “Fe T sHPTTR,"
Q02 BBNY BN “HTE DWOR)," DO BTWRFI, TySBRERIIT,E,;

() OB (W) BAS BDOR (V)T (3 ToHORE), “20T) FoedT
CRTONN)’ D0V JBENY WTON “0RY FoedT TRTOONTIE” 0W
BBHT, Ty303RCBRITE,;

(R) DO () BN NBVDOR ()3T (3)F¢ FLOIE), “SeBTEo eNRTIRY,”
DOW TJWINE IR "HTE DBOR," D0 BWNFD, T303LRIIT,B),;
3y,

(B) OB () SAT BROR (V)T (3P FoOTE), “20L3) AT
CRIONTITH” D0 V/ENY BN "D0E AT TN D0
BERATR, 7303083 3E,T,;

(xxi) 40-0d €93023. £33, -

() DOTR () TS, -

(i) VBROTB ()T (3) FoORE)., “20T) AT CBRTICNY)” dOW
BNy  BOR ‘W AT CRATIANTY” Q0D ITRFR,
23030t RIB,E,;

(i) eVWDOTBW (W)T (B TFOOIAS [DRTINY wWEOR
SDVODTTIN, T3 tBRIT,3),, NOWT:-

"S5 AT BRTANTE) 3y, NOR, BB, 3,3 ©F CeETOIRSH
WYBED, BI), OF CRTIONNY WOBY BRI T, EOR )8 80T ©OF
CRTCVNPT 953539 €930 230NT, 20053 AReIT BRTIANNH”; 203,

() OB (V) BAR (3)3¢ Fo0OTE). TR 203" 02 BENY EOR
"HIB D" DOW [WNFD, B33 ecBI3TE,;



02

(xxii) 413¢ 9B LTTAS, -

() DOR () BE)R (3)3E TPLOTE). “2,0T) TRV TRTICNNEL" 0W
IENY WBOR "D SRT CRTICNNSY” N0  BINTI,
T 3BRBRIT,E,;

(23) DOR () BAS (3)3 TLOIL), “2.0830 FRTI BRI 0
JIFNY wBOR D SeD  CRTIONNT” Q0w  BWINE,
3303083 3T,B0,;

(R) OB (X) B (3)3¢ TPOTE), “2WOTN SRV BRTIONTEN” 02
IonY EAR O JeT CATONY)’ Q0w IS,
3B RRRIT,E,

(&) DOR (B8) B (3)3¢ ToOVE), "V RV CRTICNNL)" 0
IR TOR  “2,0T00 AT  TCRTIONNTY D0 JIRINT,
Ty3BRCRRIT,T,;

(8) VOR (F) TR (B)X T200IL), "0, CeTALNRLLY” 20V
T[Ny  BTOR w0 SRV  CeTOMNRY’ D0W  BINSI,
T3V RCRRIT,R),;

(DF°) VOR (28) BN (3)ak FoOIL), “0a33), CRTICNNEH” DOW
IENY BN “W0TD  JRT)  CRTONNY)Y’ N0V  BWINYI,
330308 R3B,3,; sH3),

(%) VOB (2F°) TAR (3)3 ToOOITE), "DV ST TReaANEh”
N0V JIINY WBOR "7 TRV TRTONNS)" HO0W JTWAT,
T30 RRAIT,E,.

(xdi)) 44 ONBLTBAS () DOBT () TPOOIL), 20T ST
SRTIONNY)Y” HoW JIINY WROR "0 JRTVY TBRTICNNT)” Q0
TR, F3ABRRAIT,E,.

(oaiv) 453¢ eFLTTOS () DORT (3)6( FOOOITEL), “WOTN S[RT
CRTANNER" 202 JIWNY WBON “O0R) ST BRTIANRLR” QoW
BENT, BSBRERIIT,E,.

(xxv) 47:3¢ ODNBLBES,-

() VOB () TR (3)F FToOORE), “80833), A" WO BWNY IO
"V CRTIONNL" 0 BWNF, &SRB AIT,T,; 03,

(23) DO () TS (3)3¢ TOOVE), “DTVR) BRTY TRTICNNTL 0
[one 2BOR O [RT)  CRTANT)’ 00w IWNTI,
8030028 33,30,
fovi) 51838 9B LBTOAR () VORBT (B)F TPOOJE), “2,0TH IR
CRTONNYY" D0 JIFNY WBOR "D0R) SRV TRTIANNR” DOW
BT, F303REBRIT.,.

(xxvii) 5283¢ 9RDELBHE),,-

(@) VOB (D) TS enBOR (i) (3 ToLOTE), "20TN JRTD
CRTIONNY)’ D02 JFNY WBON "QTR) SRTY TBRTIANAL)” Q0w
BRI, FH3BRCBRIT,T,; 33,

(23) DOR () BEAS (3)3¢ TOOIE), “20TD ST TRTIONTIE)” 02
[IFNY WTOR  ‘DO0R)  [IeTY CRTONAL)" D0V  IWRII,
)3 BRLREIB,R,.



RN No. KARBIL/2001/47147 POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19
Licensed to post without prepayment WPP No. 297

0a

(xxviii) 54:3¢ 93023 LTBE -

() OB (i) AN (3) TLOTIE), “2.0L3) AIT TRTICHNL)" DOW
IJonY  wBOR  "'N0R  AIT  CRTONNSY” D0  BWRPI,
3B RCRAITE,; 53,

() OB (i) AN (3)3 FoLORE), 2,083 AIT BRETIOVNT” DO
JONY  BOR  “O0RB) AT CRTANN)” 02 BWAPI,
3303 RCBRIT,,.

(xxix) 55:3¢ 97323 £33 BTV B FVODTTD, AORIT,E),, OET:-

“56. 29,;05° M;00&3NR Jowod=é &€ .-

0

ROWORDABITE).

Al Calox 239;0T° Me;00831 | et ST BTN

(i)

B-209;0F* Mo;00&3NR FOWORAIDNTE), | TR BeTI GeETONN)

The above translation of the Karnataka Stamp (Amendment) Act, 2023

(Karnataka Act 04 of 2024) shall be authoritative text in Kannada language under
section 5-A of the Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 (Karnataka Act 26 of
1963).

PR UWOr e fés*
FTROOEEIT Uossa000)

TOF T Uos5a3000 e3T3¢T0ART
&3), 930 BADIE),
(2. 3eg3ov)
ATOF O FoODERDE,
ROADLOD Tse3TTNEH D3I,

TAS 0TS qeIngd.

dugsth marie BzeBEdx- FosuTRRG0NW, 3TFus Tads, Jeerd deod, dugmvab. Worlveth

THAMMAIAH ~ »



